CITY OF EDMONTON
BYLAW 18475

A Bylaw to amend Bylaw 17078, to authorize
the City of Edmonton to undertake, construct
and finance Transportation Project, Westwood
Transit Garage Replacement.

WHEREAS:

The Council of the City of Edmonton on March 3, 2015 duly passed Bylaw 17078,
authorizing the City of Edmonton to undertake, construct and finance Transportation Project,
Westwood Transit Garage Replacement (“Project”), and also authorizing the Mayor and Chief
Administrative Officer to borrow the sum of $186,527,000.00 for a period of up to twenty-five

(25) years with the principal and interest to be repaid in semi-annual or annual instalments;

It has now been determined that the total cost of the Project is $210,709,000.00. The
borrowing authority will therefore be increased by $10,300,000.00 from $186,527,000.00 to

$196,827,000.00;

THEREFORE, THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF EDMONTON DULY ASSEMBLED

ENACTS AS FOLLOWS:

1. Bylaw 17078 is amended in the title and in the preamble, paragraph one, thereof by deleting
the words “Transportation Project, Westwood Transit Garage Replacement” as it appears and by
substituting the words “Integrated Infrastructure Services Project, Kathleen Andrews Transit

Garage”.




Bylaw 18475 Page 2 of 4

2. The said Bylaw is further amended in the preamble, paragraph two, thereof by deleting the

figure “$201,518,000.00” as it appears and by substituting the figure “$210,709,000.00”.

3. The said Bylaw is further amended in the preamble, paragraph four and Sections (1) and (2),
thereof by deleting the figure “$186,527,000.00” as it appears and by substituting the figure

“$196,827,000.00”.

4. The said Bylaw is further amended in the preamble, paragraph seven, thereof By deleting the
date “December 31, 2013” and the amount of “$2,426,186,670.78” for the existing debt of the
City of Edmonton as it appears and substituting the date “December 31, 2017” and the figure

“$2,912,129,646.12”.

5. The said Bylaw is further amended by replacing Schedule “A” with Schedule “A” as

attached.



Bylaw 18475 Page 3 of 4

6. This Bylaw shall take effect on the day of the final passing thereof.

READ a first time this 10" day of July 2018;
READ a second time this 10" day of July 2018;
READ a third time this 10" day of July 2018;
SIGNED AND PASSED this 10" day of July 2018.

a

THE CITY OF ,EONT/(/)}\I/
o e

.....

CITY CLERK




- § €TI'S0T $ P0L88 $ LI896L § 08€ S TOSET  § 60L0IT S
- $ €TI80T $ HOL'SS $ LT896L $ 08¢ $ TOSEI  § 60L0IT §  SSBIBD YSUBLL SMIIPUY USIPE] €171-99-T1
6107 810¢ Toud jsonboy  JopQ  wonnqinumo) 150D oweN 393fo1q Joqum N 199fo1g
pue Loz  Sumoiiog L [eloL,
pajemy sy
(srefop yo spuesnoy) )
SIe9X ST
oSuIes) JISUBLY, SMAIPUY UIIYIEI] - }93[01J SIIIAIIS AINONIISBIU] PA)vISu]
WV SMPaYos

¥ 30 ¢ 93eq SLY8T meldg



