
Attachment 1 
CR_6133 

 
 
 
      CITY OF EDMONTON 
 
 
      BYLAW 18481 
 
 
       A Bylaw to amend Bylaw 18008, to authorize the   
     City of Edmonton to undertake, construct and   
     finance Citizen Services Project - Lewis Farms 
     Community Recreation Centre and Library 
 
         
WHEREAS: 
 

 The Council of the City of Edmonton on June 27, 2017 duly passed Bylaw 18008, 

authorizing the City of Edmonton to undertake, construct and finance Citizen Services Project, 

Lewis Farms Community Recreation Centre and Library (“Project”), and also authorizing the 

Mayor and Chief Administrative Officer to borrow the sum of $16,792,000.00 for a period of up 

to twenty-five (25) years with the principal and interest to be repaid in semi-annual or annual 

instalments; 

 
  It has now been determined that the total cost of the Project is $28,420,000.00.  The 

borrowing authority will therefore be increased by $7,000,000.00 from $16,792,000.00 to 

$23,792,000.00; 

 
 THEREFORE, THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF EDMONTON DULY ASSEMBLED 

ENACTS AS FOLLOWS: 

 
1. Bylaw 18008 is amended in title and in the preamble, paragraph one, thereof by deleting the 

words “Citizen Services” as it appears and by substituting the words “Integrated Infrastructure 

Services”. 



Bylaw 18481                                  Page 2 of 4 

 

2. The said Bylaw is further amended in the preamble, paragraph two, thereof by deleting the 

figure “$21,420,000.00” as it appears and by substituting the figure “$28,420,000.00”. 

 
3. The said Bylaw is further amended in the preamble, paragraph four and Sections (1) and (2), 

thereof by deleting the figure “$16,792,000.00” as it appears and by substituting the figure 

“$23,792,000.00”. 

 
4.  The said Bylaw is further amended in the preamble, paragraph seven, thereof by deleting the 

date “December 31, 2016” and the amount of “$3,338,949,882.41” for the existing debt of the 

City of Edmonton as it appears and substituting the date “December 31, 2017” and the figure 

“$2,912,129,646.12”.  

 
5. The said Bylaw is further amended by replacing Schedule “A” with Schedule “A” as 

attached. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Bylaw 18481                                  Page 3 of 4 

6. This Bylaw shall take effect on the day of the final passing thereof.  

 
 READ a first time this  day of  2018; 

 READ a second time this   day of  2018; 

 READ a third time this   day of  2018; 

 SIGNED AND PASSED this   day of 2018. 

 

                                                            THE CITY OF EDMONTON 

 

 . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  

 MAYOR            

                     

 . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  

                                                 CITY CLERK 



B
yl
aw

 1
84

81
 

   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
Pa

ge
 4
 o
f 4

 

Sc
he

du
le

 "
A

"

25
 Y

ea
rs

(in
 th

ou
sa

nd
s 

of
 d

ol
la

rs
)

Pr
oj

ec
t N

um
be

r
Pr

oj
ec

t N
am

e
E
st

im
at

ed
 

T
ot

al
 C

os
t

C
on

tr
ib

ut
io

ns
O

th
er

B
or

ro
w
in

g 
R

eq
ue

st
20

17
 a

nd
 

pr
io

r
20

18
20

19

15
-2

1-
57

85
Le

w
is 

Fa
rm

s 
C
om

m
un

ity
 

R
ec

re
at
io
n 
C
en

tre
 a
nd

 L
ib
ra
ry

28
,4
20

$ 
   
   
   

1,
12

8
$ 
   
   
   
  

3,
50

0
$ 
   
   
  

23
,7
92

$ 
   
   
   

51
3

$ 
   
   
   

19
,1
59

$ 
   
  

4,
12

0
$ 
   
   
 

28
,4

20
$ 

   
   

   
1,

12
8

$ 
   

   
   

  
3,

50
0

$ 
   

   
  

23
,7

92
$ 

   
   

   
51

3
$ 

   
   

   
19

,1
59

$ 
   

  
4,

12
0

$ 
   

   
 

In
te

gr
at

ed
 I
nf

ra
st

ru
ct

ur
e 

Se
rv

ic
es

 P
ro

je
ct

 - 
L
ew

is
 F

ar
m

s 
C

om
m

un
ity

 R
ec

re
at

io
n 

C
en

tr
e 

an
d 

L
ib

ra
ry

 


