CITY OF EDMONTON

BYLAW 20488

Bylaw 20488 to amend Revised Bylaw 18985, as amended by Bylaws
19240, 20048 and 20217, to authorize the City of Edmonton to undertake,
construct and finance Community Revitalization Levy Projects,
Downtown CRL

WHEREAS:

A. The Council of the City of Edmonton on November 5, 2019 duly passed Revised Bylaw
18985, as amended by Bylaw 19240 duly passed on June 22, 2020, as amended by Bylaw
20048 duly passed on May 9, 2022, as amended by Bylaw 20217 duly passed on August
15, 2022, authorizing the City of Edmonton to undertake, construct and finance
Community Revitalization Levy Projects, Downtown CRL (“Projects”), and also
authorizing the Mayor and Chief Administrative Officer to borrow the sum of
$87,883,000.00 for a period of twenty (20) years with the principal and interest to be

repaid in semi-annual or annual instalments;

B. The borrowing authority for the Projects will be increased by $20,407,000.00 from
$87,883,000.00 to $108,290,000.00. Furthermore, the total cost of the Projects is now

$129,469,000.00 as a result of previously approved adjustments.




Bylaw 20488 Page 2 of 4

THEREFORE, THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF EDMONTON DULY ASSEMBLED

ENACTS AS FOLLOWS:

l.

Revised Bylaw 18985 is amended in the preamble, Section (B), thereof by deleting the figure

“$107,928,000.00” as it appears and by substituting the figure “$129,469,000.00”.

The said Bylaw is further amended in the preamble, Section (D) by deleting the figure

“$87,883,000.00” as it appears and by substituting the figure “$108,290,000.00”.

. The said Bylaw is further amended in the preamble, Section (E), thereof by deleting the

words “2019 - 2022 Capital Budget” as it appears and by substituting the words “2019 - 2022

and 2023 - 2026 Capital Budgets”.

The said Bylaw is further amended in the preamble, Section (G), thereof by deleting the
paragraph “The amount of the existing debenture debt of the City of Edmonton on December
31, 2021 is $3,546,570,054.36 as calculated in accordance with the Debt Limit Regulation,
A.R. 255/2000, as amended, no part of which is in arrears;” as it appears and by substituting
a new paragraph “The amount of the existing debenture debt of the City of Edmonton on
December 31, 2022 is $3,940,329,274.54 as calculated in accordance with the City of

Edmonton Debt Management Fiscal Policy C203D, no part of which is in arrears;”.

The said Bylaw is further amended in Sections (1), (2) and (10), thereof by deleting the

figure “$87,883,000.00” as it appears and by substituting the figure “$108,290,000.00”.

The said Bylaw is further amended by replacing Schedule “A” with Schedule “A” as

attached.




Bylaw 20488 Page 3 of 4

7. This Bylaw shall take effect on the day of the final passing thereof.

READ a first time this 16th day of May 2023
READ a second time this 13th day of June 2023;
READ a third time this 13th day of June 2023;
SIGNED AND PASSED this 13th day of June 2023.
THE CITY OF EDMONTON

O

D /MAYOR

CITY CLERK



09 S 057 S €8 S O9TY S 69+67IS

9LLL S 08€'8£S £LYI€S LOTEIS $SHFIT S 067801 S 00841 S ) _
- - - 00LT - 004 - - 048’1 - - 0LTF SUIDLMSG SOEWIRI(T 12205 01 SOTH-Fi-€T
- - - FOUF 0FT°01 T - 09 - £LE LTl €51791 [EANQUIY BZET] [EIUUAURS  $016-01-1T
9LLL $ O03€8ES ELFLES €0£9 S FIET S OFTI6 § 008N $ - $ - N -8 - $ SE601S TED womio R IHFL-ND
9707 ST07 +ZT0¢ £207 Io11g 15onbay 2953y D 2AISay 2al]  adeqg AMRdolg | 09-nox apEnINy  150)) [e301 awey, Paforg Taquimy
pue 7707 Suisoarog  umejmmoq  jexedio) symamasoxdury SY-ABg ANEQEHIRISNG paremnsT 1efoxg
07 Edprongy;

(s1E7[Op JO SPUESROY) W)
sxeax 97
T vMouMo(q *5393{01g £33 UOREZI[LITANY UNWmo))

w V. 2BpYes

¥ 3O ¢ 98eg 88107 MBIAG



