CITY OF EDMONTON

BYLAW 20740

Bylaw 20740 to amend Revised Bylaw 18985, City of Edmonton
Community Revitalization Levy Projects, Downtown CRL,
Amendment #7

WHEREAS:

A. The Council of the City of Edmonton on November 5, 2019 duly passed Revised Bylaw
18985, as amended by Bylaw 19240 duly passed on June 22, 2020, as amended by Bylaw
20048 duly passed on May 9, 2022, as amended by Bylaw 20107 duly passed on May 24,
2022, as amended by Bylaw 20217 duly passed on August 15, 2022, as amended by
Bylaw 20488 duly passed on June 13, 2023, as amended by Bylaw 20566 duly passed on
October 4, 2023, authorizing the City of Edmonton to undertake, construct and finance
Community Revitalization Levy Projects, Downtown CRL (the ‘“Projects”), and also
authorizing the Mayor and Chief Administrative Officer to borrow the sum of
$70,858,000.00 for a period of twenty (20) years with the principal and interest to be

repaid in semi-annual or annual instalments;

B. The borrowing authority for the Projects will be decreased by $15,031,458.00 from
$70,858,000.00 to $55,826,542.00. Furthermore, the total cost of the Projects is now

$59,554,694.00 as a result of previously approved adjustments.




THEREFORE, THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF EDMONTON DULY ASSEMBLED

ENACTS AS FOLLOWS:

1.

Revised Bylaw 18985 is amended in the preamble, Section (B), thereof by deleting the figure

“$74,237,000.00” as it appears and by substituting the figure “$59,554,694.00”.

The said Bylaw is further amended in the preamble, Section (D) and in Sections (1), (2) and
(10), thereof by deleting the figure “$70,858,000.00” as it appears and by substituting the

figure “$55,826,542.00”.

The said Bylaw is further amended by replacing Schedule “A” with Schedule “A” as

attached.




4. This Bylaw shall take effect on the day of the final passing thereof.

READ a first time this 3rd

READ a second time this 3rd

READ a third time this 3rd

SIGNED AND PASSED this 3rd

day of
day of
day of

day of

April 2024,
April 2024,
April 2024;
April 2024.
THE CITY OF EDMONTON
&?QL\\)
MAYOR



1089 § i96°0C § FESL $ SIFOT S 078 § 09 S OLST S £76 8 9iII § 8565 S
- - - Tt L - 5487 - - FISF SmoruIeg SBEWIRIQ 19808 £01 SOTFFL-ET
- - - £69°¢1 6951 09 - €35 911 £68°91 TEMIUIY BZEIG BIUBAUWI]D  FOIS-DI-IT
2089 $  196°0T N 439 4 S 08€%T $ 8s882f § - S - s - S - $ 8§88t § Sagaq THO wOIIAG  00THHLTD
920% 70T +20T roLg 3s2nb3y QARSI esal eaey§ AMdoid  09-ROX 3ALEUTE] 1500} [B30T smey Pafoig ESQUIRN]
puE £z07 Suoxlog  3jerodio) [33: 5321 CRGR 54 sy-{ed  AN[QEUIRISNS pREWLST pafoig
el g [edomnyy

{sxefiop Jo spuesnoy) uf}
S1e3Y 0T
T waolnso(g “‘s1vsfor g 1977 HopezZI[eIssy ANTNUIs)

« ¥ FIRPPS



