
Attachment 1 
CR_7897 

 
       
       
 
 
 
      CITY OF EDMONTON 
 
 
            BYLAW 19165 
 
 
    A Bylaw to amend Bylaw 18343, to authorize  
    the City of Edmonton to construct, finance and   
    assess Decorative Street Lights Local Improvement   
    in the Virginia Park Neighbourhood    
 
 
WHEREAS: 
 

 The Council of the City of Edmonton on April 24, 2018 duly passed Bylaw 18343, 

authorizing the City of Edmonton to construct, finance and assess the Decorative Street Lights 

Local Improvement in the Virginia Park Neighbourhood (the “Project”), and also authorizing 

the Mayor and Chief Administrative Officer to borrow the sum of $27,224.00, to be paid by a 

local improvement assessment in the amount per annum for fifteen (15 years);  

 

 It has now been determined that the interest rate of the said Project authorized by Bylaw 

18343 should be 3.038% and not 3.466%, as provided for in the said bylaw and that the unit 

rate for the local improvement assessment should be $0.62 per metre for fifteen (15) years and 

not $0.64 per metre per year for fifteen (15) years as provided for in the said bylaw.  As a 

result of the listed changes, it has also now been determined that within the said bylaw the 

original Schedule “A” be replaced with a revised Schedule “A”; 

 



Bylaw 19165  Page 2 of 4 
 

 

 THEREFORE, THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF EDMONTON DULY ASSEMBLED 

ENACTS AS FOLLOWS: 

 

1. Bylaw 18343 is amended in the preamble, paragraph six, thereof by deleting the date 

“December 31, 2016” and the amount of “$3,338,949,882.41” for the existing debt of the City 

of Edmonton as it appears and substituting the date “December 31, 2019” and the figure 

“$3,202,765,050.41”. 

 

2. The said Bylaw is further amended Section (1), thereof by deleting the figure “$0.64” 

as it appears and by substituting the figure “$0.62”. 

 

3. The said Bylaw is further amended Section (3), thereof by deleting the word “three and 

four hundred-sixty-six thousandths per cent” as it appears and by replacing with “three and 

thirty-eight thousandths per cent” and by deleting the figure “3.466%” as it appears and by 

substituting the figure “3.038%”. 

 

4. The said Bylaw is further amended by replacing Schedule "A" with Schedule "A" as 

attached. 

 

 

 

 



Bylaw 19165  Page 3 of 4 
 

 

5. This Bylaw shall take effect on the day of the final passing thereof.  

 

 READ a first time this  day of  2020; 

 READ a second time this   day of  2020; 

 READ a third time this   day of  2020; 

 SIGNED AND PASSED this   day of 2020. 

 

                                                            THE CITY OF EDMONTON 

 

 

 . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  

 MAYOR                                

 

 

 . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  

                                                 CITY CLERK 



B
yl
aw

 1
91

65
 

 
 

 
Pa

ge
 4
 o
f 4

 

         

Sc
he

du
le
 "
A
"

Pa
ge

 1
 o
f 1

PR
O
PO

SE
D
 D

EC
O
R
A
T
IV

E 
ST

R
EE

T
 L
IG

H
T
S 
LO

C
A
L 
IM

PR
O
V
EM

EN
T

 L
O
C
A
L 
IM

PR
O
V
EM

EN
T
 P
R
O
JE

C
T
 3
2 
- V

IR
G
IN

IA
 P
A
R
K
 N

EI
G
H
B
O
U
R
H
O
O
D

$7
.3
6 
C
A
SH

 C
O
ST

 P
ER

 M
ET

R
E

U
N
IT

 R
A
T
E 
O
F 
$0

.6
2 
PE

R
 M

ET
R
E 
PE

R
 Y

EA
R
 F
O
R
 1
5 
Y
EA

R
S 

L.
I.

A
SS

ES
SA

B
LE

PR
O
PE

R
T
Y

PL
A
N

LE
N
G
T
H
S

SH
A
R
E

N
o.

PA
R
T

R
EF

.
SI

D
E

O
N

FR
O
M

T
O

(M
ET

R
ES

)
($
)

32
30

A
E/

W
73

 S
T
R
EE

T
A
D
A
 B

O
U
LE

V
A
R
D

10
9 
A
V
EN

U
E

29
2

   
   
   
   
   
   
   
 

2,
15

0
   
   
   
   
   
  

B
E/

W
73

 S
T
R
EE

T
11

1 
A
V
EN

U
E

11
2 
A
V
EN

U
E

12
4

   
   
   
   
   
   
   
 

91
3

   
   
   
   
   
   
  

C
E/

W
74

 S
T
R
EE

T
A
D
A
 B

O
U
LE

V
A
R
D

11
2 
A
V
EN

U
E

61
5

   
   
   
   
   
   
   
 

4,
52

7
   
   
   
   
   
  

D
E/

W
75

 S
T
R
EE

T
A
D
A
 B

O
U
LE

V
A
R
D

10
9 
A
V
EN

U
E

29
9

   
   
   
   
   
   
   
 

2,
20

1
   
   
   
   
   
  

E
S/

N
A
D
A
 B

O
U
LE

V
A
R
D

W
A
Y
N
E 
G
R
ET

Z
K
Y
 D

R
IV

E
75

 S
T
R
EE

T
63

2
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
 

4,
65

2
   
   
   
   
   
  

F
S/

N
10

9 
A
V
EN

U
E

73
 S
T
R
EE

T
75

 S
T
R
EE

T
11

5
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
 

84
7

   
   
   
   
   
   
  

G
S/

N
11

1 
A
V
EN

U
E

73
 S
T
R
EE

T
74

 S
T
R
EE

T
19

8
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
 

1,
45

8
   
   
   
   
   
  

31
A

E/
W

75
 S
T
R
EE

T
10

9 
A
V
EN

U
E

11
1 
A
V
EN

U
E

21
6

   
   
   
   
   
   
   
 

1,
59

0
   
   
   
   
   
  

B
E/

W
75

 A
 S
T
R
EE

T
11

0 
A
V
EN

U
E

11
2 
A
V
EN

U
E

12
7

   
   
   
   
   
   
   
 

93
5

   
   
   
   
   
   
  

C
E/

W
76

 S
T
R
EE

T
11

0 
A
V
EN

U
E

11
2 
A
V
EN

U
E

24
2

   
   
   
   
   
   
   
 

1,
78

2
   
   
   
   
   
  

D
S/

N
11

0 
A
V
EN

U
E

75
 S
T
R
EE

T
76

 S
T
R
EE

T
52

6
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
 

3,
87

2
   
   
   
   
   
  

E
S/

N
11

1 
A
V
EN

U
E

74
 S
T
R
EE

T
75

 A
 S
T
R
EE

T
31

2
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
 

2,
29

7
   
   
   
   
   
  

3,
69
8

   
   
   
   
   
  

27
,2
24

   
   
   
   
  

T
O
T
A
L
 A
N
N
U
A
L
 P
A
Y
M
EN
T

2,
29
2.
76

$ 
   
   
  

 


