Attachment 1
CR 7897

CITY OF EDMONTON

BYLAW 19165

A Bylaw to amend Bylaw 18343, to authorize

the City of Edmonton to construct, finance and
assess Decorative Street Lights Local Improvement
in the Virginia Park Neighbourhood

WHEREAS:

The Council of the City of Edmonton on April 24, 2018 duly passed Bylaw 18343,
authorizing the City of Edmonton to construct, finance and assess the Decorative Street Lights
Local Improvement in the Virginia Park Neighbourhood (the “Project”), and also authorizing
the Mayor and Chief Administrative Officer to borrow the sum of $27,224.00, to be paid by a

local improvement assessment in the amount per annum for fifteen (15 years);

It has now been determined that the interest rate of the said Project authorized by Bylaw
18343 should be 3.038% and not 3.466%, as provided for in the said bylaw and that the unit
rate for the local improvement assessment should be $0.62 per metre for fifteen (15) years and
not $0.64 per metre per year for fifteen (15) years as provided for in the said bylaw. As a
result of the listed changes, it has also now been determined that within the said bylaw the

original Schedule “A” be replaced with a revised Schedule “A”;



Bylaw 19165 Page 2 of 4

THEREFORE, THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF EDMONTON DULY ASSEMBLED

ENACTS AS FOLLOWS:

I. Bylaw 18343 is amended in the preamble, paragraph six, thereof by deleting the date
“December 31, 2016 and the amount of “$3,338,949,882.41” for the existing debt of the City
of Edmonton as it appears and substituting the date “December 31, 2019” and the figure

“$3,202,765,050.41”.

2. The said Bylaw is further amended Section (1), thereof by deleting the figure “$0.64”

as it appears and by substituting the figure “$0.62”.

3. The said Bylaw is further amended Section (3), thereof by deleting the word “three and
four hundred-sixty-six thousandths per cent” as it appears and by replacing with “three and
thirty-eight thousandths per cent” and by deleting the figure “3.466%” as it appears and by

substituting the figure “3.038%”.

4. The said Bylaw is further amended by replacing Schedule "A" with Schedule "A" as

attached.



Bylaw 19165 Page 3 of 4

This Bylaw shall take effect on the day of the final passing thereof.

READ a first time this day of 2020;

READ a second time this day of 2020;

READ a third time this day of 2020;

SIGNED AND PASSED this day of 2020.
THE CITY OF EDMONTON
MAYOR

CITY CLERK



9L°767°C $ INIINAVd TVANNYV TVIOL
YTTLT 869°C
L6TT a5 JATILIS V SL TATALS v ANNAAV 111 N/S q
TL8e 9Ts JATILS 9L JATALS SL HNANFAV 011 N/S a
T8L°1 we ANNHAV 11 HANAAV 011 JATILS 9L MA D
€6 LT1 ANNHAV T11 HNNAAV 011 JATILS V SL MA q
065°1 91¢ ANNFAV 111 ANNAAY 601 JHTALS SL MA % 1€
8SH'1 861 JATILS ¥L JATALS €L ANNAAV 111 N/S 9]
L8 SII JATILS SL JATALS €L HNNFAV 601 N/S a4
759 7€9 TATIIS S HANA AMZITIO ANAY M @IVATINOY VAV N/S q
102°C 66C ANNFAYV 601 @IVATINOY vaV JATALS SL MA a
LTSV S19 HNNHAV T11 @IVATINOG VAV JATILS vL MA D
€16 74 HNNHAV T11 HOANAAV 111 JATILS €L MA q
0S1°C 6T ANNFAYV 601 @IVATINOY vaV JHTALS €L MA A 0¢ (43
[€3) (STIIAN) oL WO NO AATS Y 1dVvd "ON
TIVHS SHIONHT NV1d
ALYAdOYd  HI9VSSASSV T1
SUVHA ST Y04 Y VHA Ydd TIIHN ddd 29°0$ J0 ALV LINN
TIIIN ¥dd LSOO HSVD 9€°L$
AOOHINOIHOMEN A Vd VINIDYIA - 7€ LOFOYd INTFWAAOIdINI TVIOT
INHNAAOUdIANL TVOOT SLHOI'T JAFALS FALL VIOOdd A4S0dOdd
1Jo [ 98eq
WV AMPaydg
¥ JO ¢ 93eq

S9161 melhg



