Attachment 1
CR _7447rev

CITY OF EDMONTON

BYLAW 18980

A Bylaw to amend Bylaw 18008, as amended by
Bylaw 18481, to authorize the City of Edmonton to
undertake, construct and finance Integrated
Infrastructure Services Project - Lewis Farms
Community Recreation Centre and Library

WHEREAS:

The Council of the City of Edmonton on June 27, 2017 duly passed Bylaw 18008, as
amended by Bylaw 18481 duly passed on August 21, 2018, authorizing the City of Edmonton to
undertake, construct and finance Integrated Infrastructure Services Project, Lewis Farms
Community Recreation Centre and Library (“Project”), and also authorizing the Mayor and
Chief Administrative Officer to borrow the sum of $23,792,000.00 for a period of up to twenty-

five (25) years with the principal and interest to be repaid in semi-annual or annual instalments;

It has now been determined that the total cost of the Project is $321,291,000.00. The
borrowing authority will therefore be increased by $272,871,000.00 from $23,792,000.00 to

$296,663,000.00;

THEREFORE, THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF EDMONTON DULY ASSEMBLED

ENACTS AS FOLLOWS:

1. Bylaw 18008 is amended in the preamble, paragraph two, thereof by deleting the figure

“$28,420,000.00” as it appears and by substituting the figure “$321,291,000.00”.



Bylaw 18980 Page 2 of 4

2. The said Bylaw is further amended in the preamble, paragraph three, thereof by deleting the

figure “$1,128,000.00 as it appears and by substituting the figure “$21,128,000.00”.

3. The said Bylaw is further amended in the preamble, paragraph four and Sections (1) and (2),
thereof by deleting the figure “$23,792,000.00” as it appears and by substituting the figure

“$296,663,000.00”.

4. The said Bylaw is further amended in the preamble, paragraph five, thereof by deleting the
words “2015-2018 Capital Budget” as it appears and by substituting the words “2015-2018 and

2019-2022 Capital Budget;”.

5. The said Bylaw is further amended in the preamble, paragraph seven, thereof by deleting the
date “December 31, 2017” and the amount of “$2,912,129,646.12” for the existing debt of the
City of Edmonton as it appears and substituting the date “December 31, 2018 and the figure

“$3,046,193,851.11”.

6. The said Bylaw is further amended by replacing Schedule “A” with Schedule “A” as

attached.



Bylaw 18980 Page 3 of 4

7. This Bylaw shall take effect on the day of the final passing thereof.

READ a first time this 10" day of September 2019;

READ a second time this day of 2019;

READ a third time this day of 2019;

SIGNED AND PASSED this day of 2019.
THE CITY OF EDMONTON
MAYOR

CITY CLERK



‘Sumo110q 2IMULGIP MU JudsaIdar [im

6L6°06C$ Surrewox ogy pue (86L°4$) TS8FT PUe (LOT$) 18F11 (€7$) 9TTHT (66S$) TLPYT “(LETS) 8€TST smejhq uo sSurmortoq snomard woy pagdde oq im $89°¢§ “Auoyne Sumorioq £99°967$ A JO«

SII'SS $§ 9S6'8S S Lb6'€9 § €9I°L9 $ 00611 § pSTLE § 8IET $  €99°967 § 00S‘€ $ 8TI'IC $ 16T°1TE §
SIT'SS  $§ 9568 § L¥6'€9 § €91°L9 $ 006°11 $§ +STLE § 8TET $ *€99°96T § 00S°C $ 8TI‘lT $ 16T7ICe $  ATRIqUT puE anue)) UONEAIRY G8LS-1C-C1
Aununuo)) swie,f Simo|
70T €707 0T 1207 0707 610T Joug ysanboy 0D-Nox  suopnqLyuo) 3s0) [BI0L aureN 3a3fo1qg Jaqumy] 32301
pue 8107 Sumorrog  -sy-Aeq payemn sy
(sxe[jop yo spuesnoy) ur)
SIBdX ST
Areaqry pue anud)) UoNEAIIIY AUNUILO0)) SULIE] SIIT )93[01J SIINAIIS MO SBIJU] PI)eI3u]
:<: QEQQF—QW

7 J0 ¢ 98eq

08681 MelAq



