CITY OF EDMONTON

BYLAW 19368

A Bylaw to amend Bylaw 18987, to authorize the
City of Edmonton to undertake, construct and finance
Integrated Infrastructure Services Projects,
Neighbourhood Renewal Program Reconstruction —
Alberta Avenue, Central McDougall, Highlands,
Inglewood and Royal Gardens

WHEREAS:

The Council of the City of Edmonton on November 5, 2019 duly passed Bylaw 18987,
authorizing the City of Edmonton to undertake, construct, and finance Integrated Infrastructure
Services Projects, Neighbourhood Renewal Program Reconstruction — Alberta Avenue, Central
McDougall, Highlands, Inglewood and Royal Gardens (“Projects”), and also authorizing the
Mayor and Chief Administrative Officer to borrow the sum of $4,910,000.00 for a period of
fifteen (15) years with the principal and interest to be repaid in semi-annual or annual

instalments;

It has now been determined that the total cost of the Projects is $204,877,000.00. The
borrowing authority will therefore be increased by $811,456.00 from $4,910,000.00 to

$5,721,456.00;

THEREFORE, THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF EDMONTON DULY ASSEMBLED

ENACTS AS FOLLOWS:

1. Bylaw 18987 is amended in the preamble, Section (B), thereof by deleting the figure

“$208,100,000.00” as it appears and by substituting the figure “$204,877,000.00”.




Bylaw 19368 Page 2 of 3

2. The said Bylaw is further amended in the preamble, Section (D) and Sections (1), (2) and
(10), thereof by deleting the figure “$4,910,000.00” as it appears and by substituting the figure

“$5,721,456.00”.

3. The said Bylaw is further amended in the preamble, Section (G), thereof by deleting the date
“December 31, 2018 and the amount of “$3,046,193,851.11” for the existing debt of the City of
Edmonton as it appears and substituting the date “December 31, 2019” and the figure
“$3,202,765,050.41”.

4. The said Bylaw is further amended by replacing Schedule “A” with Schedule “A” as
attached.

5. This Bylaw shall take effect on the day of the final passing thereof.

READ a first time this 17" day of August 2020;
READ a second time this 21%  dayof September  2020;
READ a third time this 21 day of September  2020;
SIGNED AND PASSED this 21 day of September  2020.

THE CITY Q MOXTON

....................

. )
' /C/(/,M/\w éua/o e L

............................

CITY CLERK




- $ TI8 $ 016 $ IS $ vLE $ 0I€E PIL'0ST $ SSLPI $ LL8YOT $

- - 85y 8sh - L8T 35574 [ifAN4 0ot'LT SuspIeD) [2A0Y - UOHONLSU0OSY JUN S106-0t-61

- 118 SLET 981°C vLE $8T 6E°SH 099°¢ L68'1S Poomaf3u] - uononxsuodsy JAN £106-0v-61

- - L0g LOE - 9zL1 6L 82EC 080°L¥ SPUBIYSIH - UononusuooTy JIN Z106-0t-61

- - 18%°C 18%°C - 67T 8TS'€C 9L1 000°8C T[e3NOCIIA [ENURD) - UOHINISU0IYY YN 1106-0t-61

- $ - $ 68C $ 68C $ - $ 8L ovs'sy $ 888°C $ 00s°0S $ SNUSAY BUI(Q[Y - UOBINNSUOITY N 0106-0t-61
1202 0202 ETIE 35anbayy AR eI} RELTS) JAIISIY [eMdRy  adeqs Adorg  IS0) [EI0] ETONERE] (X P { Jaquiny] 393103 g

pHE 6[07 Sumoriog Ajqeaieisng POOTLIOQUSIAN Jusurdscduny payBwBSY

Jedpiuny

18307

(sxe[fop Jo spuesnoi) u)
SIBIX S1

suap.aes) [BA0y puE pooMmd|Su ‘SPUEIgSIH TESNOIIA [BAIUI)) UNUIAY BLIIQY - TORINISU0INY WEIS0.1J [EMUY POOYINoqy3IaN ‘$)99f01d SINAIIG 2ININKSEIU] PIjeLSHU]

uwViu IMpIYIs

€ Jo ¢ o8eq

89¢6 1 MBIAY



