CITY OF EDMONTON
BYLAW 19374

A Bylaw to amend Bylaw 15977, as amended by

Bylaws 17092, 17179, 18217 and 19243, to authorize
the City of Edmonton to undertake, construct and finance
The Quarters Downtown Community Revitalization
Levy Areas Projects

WHEREAS:

The Council of the City of Edmonton on January 18, 2012 duly passed Bylaw 15977, as
amended by Bylaw 17092 duly passed on March 3, 2015, as amended by Bylaw 17179 duly
passed on April 28, 2015, as amended by Bylaw 18217 duly passed on January 23, 2018, as
amended by Bylaw 19243 duly passed on April 27, 2020, authorizing the City of Edmonton to
undertake, construct and finance The Quarters Downtown Community Revitalization Levy Areas
Projects (“Projects”), and also authorizing the Mayor and Chief Administrative Officer to borrow
the sum of $93,371,484.00 for a period of twenty (20) years with the principal and interest to be

repaid in semi-annual or annual instalments;

It has now been determined that the total cost of the Projects is $103,010,854.00. The
borrowing authority will therefore be decreased by $987,465.00 from $93,371,484.00 to

$92,384,019.00;




Bylaw 19374 Page 2 of 4

THEREFORE, THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF EDMONTON DULY ASSEMBLED

ENACTS AS FOLLOWS:

1. Bylaw 15977 is amended in the preamble, paragraph two, thereof by deleting the figure

“$103,998,319.00” as it appears and by substituting the figure “$103,010,854.00”.

2. The said Bylaw is further amended in the preamble, paragraph four, Sections (1) and (2),
and in the enactment, thereof by deleting the figure “$93,371,484.00” as it appears and by

substituting the figure “$92,384,019.00”.

3. The said Bylaw is further amended in the preamble, paragraph seven, thereof by deleting the
date “December 31, 2018” and the amount of “$3,046,193,851.11” for the existing debt of the
City of Edmonton as it appears and substituting the date “December 31, 2019” and the figure

“$3,202,765,050.41”.

4. The said Bylaw is further amended by replacing Schedule “A” with Schedule “A” as

attached.




Bylaw 19374 Page 3 of 4

5. This Bylaw shall take effect on the day of the final passing thereof.

READ a first time this 5t day of October 2020;
READ a second time this 5 day of October 2020;
READ a third time this < day of October 2020;
SIGNED AND PASSED this 5" day of October 2020.

CITY CLERK



YLE'EE $ 0I0°6S $ ¥8€76 § LII'6 S 00S°L S T10°€01 $

€SL°T 8ELE 16v°9 - - 169 qred meunswry - 6001-8¢-L1

LS6°TT LLSTT ves'ee - 0081 yeese 11 958U - UMOIUMO(] SIOMENY 3L, [€0b-pL-C1

000°S - 000°S LT1°6 - LTIYL JI0MISN 19311§ Ue]d uonel§ wnipel§ poy  LIT€-LI-C1

$99°¢ $ g6y $ 6S0°LY $ - $§ - § 6S0°Ly $ [ aseqq - s1epend) oYL LOVO-LI-TT

0707 1011 jsanbayy 09-N0X sjuein) 350D [B10], awe) 133foag Jaquinp] 19afoag
pPU® 6107 Sumo.aaog -sy-Aegq parewysy

(sae[[op Jo spuesnoy} ur)

SIBIX 0T
s300f01g SBAIY KA UOIIEZI[€}IAIY AJIUNUIWO)) UMOJUMO( $19)18n() YL

:<= Q—:gosuw

 JO 1 93eq vLE6T MmelAg



